
Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16415 

Work No.  01  

Work Name  Installation of 10 KV MHP Habibullah Abad 

Cost 2.0 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Gul  Shahzada M/S GUL SHAHZADA 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 

10159182336787 21.40% Below Awarded 03,April 2022 
18:21:20 

 

2 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 21.00 % Below  03,April 2022 
21:09:33 

 

3 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 20.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
12:00:10 

 

4 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 16.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
19:08:36 

  

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    

   ________________      ________________ 

                 1 of 1 

APRIL 04, 2022                 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16416 

Work No.  02  

Work Name  Installation of 5 KV MHP Mir Ghazan Abad 

Cost 2.0 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 21.00 % Below Awarded 03,April 2022 
21:09:33 

 

2 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 20.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
12:00:10 

 

3 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 16.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
19:08:36 

  

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    

   ________________      ________________ 

 

 

                 1 of 1 

APRIL 04, 2022 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16417 

Work No.  03 

Work Name  WSS at Siraj u Din Abad UC Bar Jalkot 

Cost 3.4 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 21.00 % Below Awarded 02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

2 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 19.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
13:10:16 

 

3 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 17.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
15:03:39 

  

4 Gul Shahzada M/S GULSHAHZADA 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 

10159182336787 16.35% Below  03,April 2022 
19:35:08 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    

   ________________      ________________ 

 

 

APRIL 04, 2022               1 of 1 



 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16418 

Work No.  04 

Work Name  Installation of 5 KV MPH Sazin Asmat Ullah Abad 

Cost 1.5 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 21.50 % Below Awarded 02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

2 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 19.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
14:27:27 

 

3 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 17.15 % Below  01,April 2022 
18:08:47 

  

4 Gul Shahzada M/S GULSHAHZADA 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 

10159182337520 16.40% Below  03,April 2022 
19:35:08 

 

5 Muhammad 
Yahya 

M/S MUHAMMAD YAHYA  & 
CO 

10159182337102 12.50% Below  02,April 2022 
21:16:01 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    

   ________________      ________________ 

 

APRIL 04,2022               1 of 1 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16419 

Work No.  05 

Work Name  Construction of Shingle Road Raika Zmain Road to Noor Muhammad Abad 

Cost 2.5 (M)  

 

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Gul Shahzada M/S GUL SHAHZADA 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 

10159182338174 23.00 % Below Awarded 03,April 2022 
14:16:51 

 

2 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 19.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
13:10:16 

 

3 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 17.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
15:03:39 

  

4 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 16.95% Below  03,April 2022 
19:35:08 

 

5 Muhammad 
Yahya 

M/S MUHAMMAD YAHYA   10159182320201 16.50 % Below  03,April 2022 
22:03:39 

 

6 Faju M/S FAJU & BROTHERS 10159182333602 16.25% Below  03,April 2022 
21:35:08 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    



   ________________      ________________ 

 

APRIL 04, 2022               2 of 2 

 

 

 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16420 

Work No.  06 

Work Name  Construction of Zaid Khar Bukh mal Sher Abad 

Cost 2.5 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Gul Shahzada M/S GULSHAHZADA 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 

10159182338841 22.00% Below Awarded 03,April 2022 
21:38:13 

 

2 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182338745 21.70 % Below  02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

3 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182318752 20.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
13:10:16 

 

4 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182338771 20.00 % Below  02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

5 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182328788 18.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
15:03:39 

  

6 Muhammad 
Yahya 

MUHAMMAD YAHYA & CO 10159182328721 18.05% Below  03,April 2022 
11:08:39 

 

7 Mujeeb ur 
Rehman 

M/S LOWER KOHISTAN 10159182328702 15.00 % Below  03,April 2022 
18:21:39 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 



    

   ________________      ________________ 

 

APRIL 04,2022               2 of 2 

 

 

 

 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16421 

Work No.  07 

Work Name  Construction of DOGA Road 

Cost 2.5 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182338801 22.50 % Below Awarded 02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

2 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182318815 20.24 % Below  02,April 2022 
13:10:16 

 

3 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182338852 20.00 % Below  02,April 2022 
10:13:45 

 

4 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182328845 18.15 % Below  03,April 2022 
15:03:39 

  

5 Muhammad 
Yahya 

MUHAMMAD YAHYA & CO 10159182328874 18.05% Below  03,April 2022 
11:08:39 

 

6 Mujeeb ur 
Rehman 

M/S LOWER KOHISTAN 10159182328891 15.00 % Below  03,April 2022 
18:21:39 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    



   ________________      ________________ 

 

APRIL 04,2022               2 of  2 

 

 

 

 

 



Final Comparative Statement 

TMA – Dassu  

NIT No.  16422  

Work No.  08 

Work Name  Construction of shingle road farooq shah mour to zardad abad 

Cost 2.5 (M)  

 

S. 
No 

Contractor Name Firm Name Form No Bid Awarded Applied Date 
Time  

Remarks 

1 Gul Shahzada  M/S GUL SHAHZADA 
CONTRUCTION COMPANY 

1015918486747 22.00 % Below Awarded 03,April 2022 
16:09:33 

 

2 Javid M/S SEMO & COMPANY  10159182325010 16.15 % Below  30 ,March 2022 
19:08:36 

 

3 Wali Muhammad M/S WALI MUHAMMAD & 
BROTHERS 

10159182315023 20.24 % Below  28, March 2022 
12:00:10 

  

4 Sirdad Khan M/S JILDAD & BROTHERS 10159182336747 21.00 % Below  02 , April 2022 
21:09:33 

 

 

 

________________     _____________________    __________________ 

    

   ________________      ________________ 
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